
Bid Opening 
 

Camden County 
Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements 

Bid Date: October 27, 2011 at 2:00 p.m. 
 

Bidder Total Base 
Bid 

Total Base Bid Plus 
Alternate 1- Sand 

Media 

Total Base Bid Plus 
Alternate 2- Disk 

Filter 
Eberhart Construction, Inc. $212,000.00 $676,000.00 $556,000.00 
Water & Waste Systems 

Construction, Inc. $298,000.00 $687,900.00 $568,000.00 

State Utility Contractors, Inc. $325,000.00 $557,000.00 $557,000.00 

Turner Murphy Company, Inc. $330,637.00 $702,237.00 $585,637.00 

T.A. Loving Company $558,000.00 $913,000.00 $818,000.00 

AC Schultes of Carolina, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid 

English Construction Co.,, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Hatchell Concrete, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid 
 
 
 
 
 
Consulting Engineers 
1240 19th Street Lane NW 
Hickory, North Carolina 28603 
Doug Chapman, PE 


