
Bid Results 
Moore County Schools 

Cameron Elementary Pump Station and Force Main 
Bid Date: June 2, 2011 at 2:00 p.m. local time 

 
 

 

Bidder 
Total Base 

Bid + Alt. 1 & 
2 

Total Base 
Bid + Alt. 1 

Bid 

Total Base + 
Alt. 2 Bid 

Total Base 
Bid 

Sanford Construction $683,500.00 $679,700.00 $676,500.00 $672,700.00 

T.A. Loving Company $769,000.00 $769,000.00 $765,000.00 $765,000.00 

Ritchie Construction $780,005.48 $777,005.48 $771,105.48 $768,105.48 

Terry’s Plumbing & 
Utilities, Inc. 

$794,000.00 $794,000.00 $782,000.00 $782,000.00 

SKC, Inc. Utility 
Contractors 

$831,825.00 $828,325.00 $825,025.00 $821,525.00 

Concord Builders, Inc. $828,800.00 $828,800.00 $828,800.00 $828,800.00 

Sandhill Contractors, Inc. $867,768.99 $863,468.99 $867,768.99 $863,468.99 

Columbus Utilities  $924,849.00 $921,649.00 $926,849.00 $923,649.00 

Buckeye Construction, 
Inc. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Herring-Rivenbark, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

L-J, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

State Utility Contractors, 
Inc. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
 
 
 
 
Consulting Engineers 
6 Regional Drive, Suite D 
Pinehurst, North Carolina  28374 
Clark L. Thomas, PE 


